
 

 

2.85 Acres 
MLS #129175 

UC #23042-29175 

Kelly Parker 
mkparker315@bellsouth.net 
Office: (601) 250-0017 
Cell: (601) 324-9760 
GibsonRealtyMS.com 

808 Copiah Street, Summit 
 

Adorable 1920’s Bungalow 
style home just north of the 
small town of Summit, MS will 
steal your heart with its’ 
natural light, hardwood floors, 
and plenty of acreage for 
playing outside! Equipped with 
a large and a medium 
workshop, you’ll have lots of 
space to store your toys and 
work on projects! The large 
covered back porch draws 
you out of the pretty kitchen to 
enjoy your yard! Paved drive, 
solar panels and handicapped 
tub are some of the unique 
features of this home. This is 
one of only 2 homes on this 
dead end street! 

31.290815, -90.466799 GPS 

$89,500 

Gibson Realty & 
Land Company 
 


