
 

 

3 Bed/1 Bath 
1.0± Acres 

MLS #143378 
 

Danielle Burnette 
dandynburn@gmail.com 
Office: (601) 250-0017 
Cell: (601) 249-7061 
SouthernStatesRealty.com 

1449 Monticello Street NE, Brookhaven, MS 
 

Welcome to your charming 1950s 
block and wood home nestled in 
the heart of Lincoln County, 
Brookhaven, MS! This delightful 
property features three bedrooms 
and one bathroom. Set on a 
generous one-acre lot, this home 
boasts a low-maintenance metal 
roof and an inviting porch—ideal for 
enjoying warm evenings or morning 
coffee. The all-electric setup 
provides convenience and 
efficiency, ensuring your comfort 
year-round. The interior offers a 
blend of vintage charm and modern 
functionality, with ample natural 
light. You'll appreciate the outdoor 
space, perfect for gardening, play 
or simply unwinding. Don't miss this 
opportunity to own a slice of 
Brookhaven charm. Schedule your 
showing today!  

31.561762, -90.396154 GPS 

$100,000 


