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Fwd: Meter Request

tracy alexander <tracyoalexander@gmail.com>
Thu 4/4/2024 4:07 PM
To: Kim Hill <kim@hillcountrypros.com> 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Coryell City Water <info@coryellcitywater.com>
Date: Thu, Apr 4, 2024 at 11:48 AM
Subject: Meter Request
To: tracyoalexander@gmail.com <tracyoalexander@gmail.com>

Good afternoon, 
A meter request was recently received for CR 194 Jonesboro GPS coordinates 31.56822, -97.85894 and
a meter request for CR 194 Jonesboro GPS coordinates 31.56768, -97.85999. Both meter requests have
been approved with the requirement of a road bore for each. Each road bores start at $4,000.00 and
meters are $4,030.00 each. We would need payment in full as well as an easement and service
agreement for each location. If you would like to proceed with this request, you can find all our forms
on our website. If you have any questions or concerns please let us know. 

Thank you,
Coryell City Water Supply
www.coryellcitywater.com
9440 FM 929
Gatesville, TX 76528
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